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J560 

HYPER CLEAN
CLEANER-SANITIZER-DISINFECTANT 

KILLS 99.99% OF FUNGI, BACTERIA AND VIRUSES 
GUARANTEE: hydrogen peroxide – 6.9% w/w 

D.I.N. 02511940

Hyper Clean is a hydrogen peroxide based cleaner, sanitizer and 
disinfectant with bleaching and deodorizing properties. It is 
intended for use in commercial settings such as institutions, 
hospitals, and food processing areas. 
It is a fully biodegradable product with environmental benefits not 
normally found in cleaning compounds. It is a mild yet effective 
cleaner that provides superior cleaning properties, and the 
hydrogen peroxide breaks down to form water and oxygen, 
leaving minimal chemical residue.   

SANITIZATION AND DISINFECTION: For use as a sanitizer or 
disinfectant on hard, nonporous surfaces only. For heavily soiled 
surfaces, a pre-cleaning step is required. Use 80 mL per L of 
water (5111 ppm in-use concentration). Apply with a cloth or 
mop. Allow surface to remain wet for 10 minutes, then remove 
excess liquid. Prepare a fresh solution for each use. Rinse and 
allow to dry. When used on food equipment or food contact 
items, completely drain the product from all food contact surfaces 
and rinse with potable water. Avoid contamination of food. 

CLEANING: It is suitable for a variety of cleaning applications 
including laundry, washrooms, windows, floors, walls and 
ceilings. It is also ideal for carpet stain removal and as a non-acid 
bowl cleaner. Hyper Clean can be used undiluted for tough jobs 
or diluted up to 10 mL/L for light duty cleaning. 
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